



28 May 2021

Request	Response												
1. Please provide the number of incidents attended by St John's Honorary Police in the year of 2019 and 2020 (whether requested by Parishioners or States of Jersey Police).	This information is not held by the Parish but may be available through the States of Jersey Police.												
2. Please provide St John Honorary Police's honorarium expenses for each ranking officer for the year 2019 and 2020.	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Financial year to April</th> <th>2019</th> <th>2020</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Centeniers</td> <td>£2,250</td> <td>£2,250</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Vingteniers</td> <td>£700</td> <td>£600</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Constable's Officers</td> <td>£1,000</td> <td>£952</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Financial year to April	2019	2020	Centeniers	£2,250	£2,250	Vingteniers	£700	£600	Constable's Officers	£1,000	£952
Financial year to April	2019	2020											
Centeniers	£2,250	£2,250											
Vingteniers	£700	£600											
Constable's Officers	£1,000	£952											
3. Please provide an accurate number of Parish Hall Enquiry evenings held by St John's for purposes of offenders appearing at Parish Hall Enquiry (I am aware that one night a week is scheduled for bookings – however please provide actual attendance numbers) for the year 2019 and 2020.	The number of Parish Hall Enquiries held were: 2019 - 9 2020 - 17												
4. How many officer hours have officers been on duty within the Parish in their duty week (please note, this is not for a duty week, this means in relation to proactive duties, providing reassurance to Parishioners) for the year 2019 & 2020.	This information is not held.												
5. How many officers do St John's have currently elected; how many have completed the basic training and how many officers have attended CPD days for continuous development.	14 currently elected; all have completed a foundation course (basic training). All officers have attended appropriate training courses as part of their on-going training and development as a member of the Honorary Police. The Connétable and Chef de Police are actively reviewing the programme for on-going training.												
6. How many speed devices (Unipar Speed device) does the Parish own, when was the last calibration of the device, how many times has the device been booked out in 2019 & 2020. How many trained officers do St John's have?	One device. Last calibration July 2020. No information is held on the number of times the device has been booked out in 2019 and 2020. 3 Officers are fully trained to use the speed detection device and 4 Officers are in the process of completing the training.												
7. In regard to the above question – how many offenders have been reported for speeding related offences by St John Honorary Officers in 2019 and 2020.	Specific details as to whether reports were made by St John Honorary Officers or SOJP are not available at Parish Hall but may be available from SOJP. The total number would be included in the number of enquiries held –see Question 3.												
8. In relation to speed detection devices, how much do the Parish spend on maintenance of the device yearly.	<table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>Financial year to April</th> <th>2020</th> <th>2021</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Speed Gun</td> <td>£279</td> <td>£357</td> </tr> <tr> <td>Smiley Face Maintenance</td> <td>£54</td> <td>£46</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Financial year to April	2020	2021	Speed Gun	£279	£357	Smiley Face Maintenance	£54	£46			
Financial year to April	2020	2021											
Speed Gun	£279	£357											
Smiley Face Maintenance	£54	£46											

<p>9. How many officers are trained in the use of the speed device to report offenders.</p>	<p>Please see response to Question 6.</p>						
<p>10. In relation to the St John Honorary Police vehicle, please confirm the purchase cost of this vehicle, which officers have access to use the vehicle for patrols and what training is provided in relation to driver training. Please confirm cost of fuel for 2019 and 2020 and how many times the vehicle was utilised in these years.</p>	<p>Purchase cost of Police vehicle: the information is exempt under Article 23 (Information accessible to applicant by other means) as it was supplied in the response dated 27 August 2019 available on the FOI tab of the Parishes website https://parish.gov.je (£16,000 (2014)).</p> <p>Any Officer with a full licence is able to drive the police vehicle. We have no Officers trained to drive in emergency response conditions.</p> <p>Information on the number of times the vehicle was used is not held.</p> <table border="1" data-bbox="762 629 1394 701"> <thead> <tr> <th>Financial year to April</th> <th>2020</th> <th>2021</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr> <td>Petrol Account</td> <td>£163.75</td> <td>£165.04</td> </tr> </tbody> </table>	Financial year to April	2020	2021	Petrol Account	£163.75	£165.04
Financial year to April	2020	2021					
Petrol Account	£163.75	£165.04					

