



3 August 2020

Request

1. For each individual parish can you please list the names and details of each lane categorised as a Green Lane. For St Saviour and Trinity with no Green Lanes please provide the names and details of every road in the parish with a speed limit under 20mph.
2. Should the data be held at the parish please provide details of all motoring offences on any of the individual parishes green lanes / lanes under 20mph since 1 January 2016 broken down by year.
3. Should the data be held at the parish please provide details of the highest speed recorded in a Green Lane/Lane under 20mph in each individual parish over the course of each year since 1 January 2016.
4. Should the data be held at the parish please provide details of the number of speed or road side checks undertaken on Green Lanes / lanes under 20mph since 1 January 2016.
5. Should the data be held at the parish please provide the statistics recorded from any monitoring devices (speed and volume of traffic capture) on any of the individual parish Green lanes/lanes under 20mph with the accompanying data detailing capture dates and times.

Response

1. This information is absolutely exempt.

FOI exemption applied:

Article 23 - Information accessible to applicant by other means

Information is absolutely exempt information if it is reasonably available to the applicant, otherwise than under this Law, whether or not free of charge. A scheduled public authority that refuses an application for information on this ground must make reasonable efforts to inform the applicant where the applicant may obtain the information.

Justification for exemption

Jersey Law

All Jersey laws are available on www.jerseylaw.je. Unless a lower speed limit is set in the Road Traffic (Speed Limits) (Jersey) Order 2003 <https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/revised/Pages/25.550.44.aspx> as amended <https://www.jerseylaw.je/laws/enacted/Pages/RO-014-2019.aspx>, the speed limit on all roads in Jersey is set in the Road Traffic (Jersey) Law 1956.

The Road Traffic (Speed Limits) (Jersey) Order 2003 specifies in Schedule 3 that a motor vehicle shall not be driven at a speed exceeding 15 miles per hour on the roads listed.

There are no roads in St Saviour or Trinity with a speed limit under 20 m.p.h. (though Schedule 2 lists some roads in St Saviour where a motor vehicle shall not be driven at a speed exceeding 20 miles per hour and there is a part-time speed limit of 20 miles per hour outside Trinity School).

2. Details of all motoring offences on any of the individual parishes green lanes / lanes under 20mph since 1 January 2016 broken down by year

Parish	Motoring offences
St Helier	<p><u>2016-2018</u> - Not held</p> <p><u>2019</u> Les Ruisseaux - 18th March (6 words of advice given) 25th March (1 words of advice given) 1st April (1 Parish Hall Enquiry, outcome not held by Parish, held by States Police) 8th April (1 Parish Hall Enquiry, outcome not held by Parish, held be States Police) 15th April (2 words of advice given) 22nd April (1 Parish Hall Enquiry, outcome not held by parish, held by States Police) Oaklands Lane - 1st July No offenses 8th July (8 words of advice given) Vallee Des Vaux 3rd August (2 words of advice) 10th August - No offences 17th August - No offences</p> <p><u>2020</u> Valley Des Vaux 5th January – No offences. 8th January (8 words of advice, 2 Parish Hall Enquires, no results as haven't taken place yet due to Covid)</p>
St Lawrence	<p><u>2016, 2017 and 2019</u> – not held</p> <p><u>2018</u> Speed check held on Les Charrieres Malorey on 6/07/2018 – 1 ticket issued for speeding at 29mph. 3 x words of advice given to motorists.</p> <p><u>2020</u> Speed check held on Les Charrieres Malorey on 2/07/2020 – Honorary Police Officers only saw 2 vehicles in a 30 minute period – No speeding.</p>
<p>St Brelade, St Clement, Grouville, St John, St Martin, St Mary, St Ouen and St Peter – information not held.</p> <p>There are no roads in St Saviour or Trinity with a speed limit under 20 m.p.h.</p>	

3. Details of the highest speed recorded in a Green Lane/Lane under 20mph in each individual parish over the course of each year since 1 January 2016

Parish	Highest speed
St Helier	<p><u>2016 – February 2019</u> – not held</p> <p><u>From March 2019 onwards</u> Valley Des Vaux on 16 November 2019 = 44mph</p>

	<p><u>2020</u> Oaklands Lane on 17 March 2020 = 70mph</p> <p>No details are held in relation to the highest speed recorded in Honorary Police speed checks</p>
St Lawrence	<p><u>2018</u> – 29 mph</p> <p><u>2020</u> – no speed in excess of speed limit</p>
St Martin	<p><u>2016</u> La Longue Rue: 20.02.16 – over 40 mph but less than 50mph between 14:00hrs and 14:30hrs X 1 vehicle 22.02.16 – over 40 mph but less than 50mph between 22:30hrs and 23:00hrs X 1 vehicle Rue Des Alleurs: 10.03.16 – over 40 mph but less than 50mph between 06:00hrs and 06:30hrs X 1 vehicle Rue de Sergeant: 01.12.16 – over 40 mph but less than 50 mph x 1 vehicle</p> <p><u>2017</u> Rue Des Alleurs: 20.01.17 – over 40 mph but less than 50 mph between 18:30hrs and 19:00 x 1 vehicle</p> <p><u>2018</u> La Longue Rue: 21.11.18 - over 40 mph but less than 50mph between 21:00hrs and 21:30hrs X 1 vehicle 23.11.18 - over 40 mph but less than 50mph between 19:30hrs and 20:00hrs X 1 vehicle 17.12.18 - over 40 mph but less than 50mph between 19:00hrs and 19:30hrs X 1 vehicle</p> <p><u>2019</u> La Longue Rue: 02.01.19 - over 40 mph but less than 50mph between 19:30hrs and 20:00hrs X 1 vehicle</p>
<p>St Brelade, St Clement, Grouville, St John, St Mary, St Ouen and St Peter – information not held.</p> <p>There are no roads in St Saviour or Trinity with a speed limit under 20 m.p.h.</p>	

4. Details of the number of speed or road side checks undertaken on Green Lanes / lanes under 20mph since 1 January 2016

Parish	Number of speed or road side checks undertaken
St Helier	<p>The following speed checks were undertaken by Honorary Police in green lanes. In addition a number of Speed Indication Devices (SIDs) have been deployed across Parish Roads, including Green Lanes; please refer to response 5 for details.</p> <p><u>2019</u> La Grande Route De Mont a L'abbe 11th November 30 vehicles monitored</p>

	<p>18th November 56 vehicles monitored La Route De Petit Clos 4th March 2019 30 vehicles monitored Les Ruisseaux 4th March 30 vehicles monitored 11th March 23 vehicles monitored 18th March 30 vehicles monitored 25th March 20 vehicles monitored 1st April 31 vehicles monitored 8th April 31 vehicles monitored 15th April 20 vehicles monitored 22nd October 10 vehicles monitored Oaklands Lane 1st July 35 vehicles monitored 8th July 35 vehicles monitored Vallee Des Vaux 3rd August 17 vehicles monitored 10th August 30 vehicles monitored 17th August 16 vehicles monitored</p> <p><u>2020</u></p> <p>Valley Des Vaux 5th January 11 vehicles monitored 0 reported. Valley Des Vaux 5th January 56 vehicles monitored.</p>
St Lawrence	Two checks, please refer to response 2 for details.
St Martin	No checks other than Speed Indication Devices (SIDs), please refer to response 5 for details
St Brelade, St Clement, Grouville, St John, St Mary, St Ouen and St Peter – information not held. There are no roads in St Saviour or Trinity with a speed limit under 20 m.p.h.	

5. Statistics recorded from any monitoring devices (speed and volume of traffic capture) on any of the individual parish Green lanes/lanes under 20mph with the accompanying data detailing capture dates and times

Parish / Year	Statistics recorded
St Helier	Attached five reports from the Speed Indication Devices (SIDs) for 2019 and three separate reports for 2020.
St Martin	40 reports from 2016 onwards attached
St Brelade, St Clement, Grouville, St John, St Lawrence, St Mary, St Ouen and St Peter – information not held. There are no roads in St Saviour or Trinity with a speed limit under 20 m.p.h.	